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Spartech Readies for Premier SHOT Show in Las Vegas 
 
ST. LOUIS, MO. (January 7, 2020) - Spartech, a leading plastics manufacturer, announced today 
the company will be exhibiting at the SHOT Show Supplier Showcase January 20-21 in Las 
Vegas.  
 
“We are excited to be participating for the first time in this premier show, and look forward to 
showcasing our outstanding products to the thousands of attendees,” said Joe Herres, Spartech 
Vice President of Sales and Marketing. “We invite attendees to stop by our booth to learn more 
about our leading-edge solutions, including our Royalite HG Holster Grade Sheet.” 
 
Considered the largest and most comprehensive trade show for professionals involved with the 
shooting sports, hunting and law enforcement industries, the SHOT Show will feature several 
marquee events including the Supplier Showcase, where Spartech will be exhibiting (booth 
#52541) its Royalite HG Holster Grade Sheet™ and Polycast Bullet Resistant Acrylic Sheet.™  
 
In addition, Spartech will have a booth (#5) at the Industry Day at the Range™  -  
the largest, most influential one-day event for hunting and shooting sports enthusiasts.  
 
Spartech’s Royalite HG Holster Grade Sheet is a tough and durable thermoplastic sheet that 
offers an effective solution for formed and fabricated handgun holsters and knife sheaths.” 
 
About the Royalite Holster Grade Sheet 
 

• Excellent durability 

• Wide range of colors, textures and patterns 

• Forms easily over handgun molds 

• Easy to machine fasten mechanically or bond with adhesives 

• Good resistance to chemicals and cleaners 

• Available in gauges from 0.028 to 0.125 
 
Spartech’s Polycast Bullet Resistant Acrylic Sheet fits a range of protective applications and is 
UL designated, abrasion resistant, lighter than glass, crystal clear and design-flexible to fit a 
variety of ballistic protection applications.  
 

-more- 
 
  

https://shotshow.org/supplier-showcase/
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/flame-rated-sheet-and-other-specialty-sheet-solutions/royalite-hg
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/superior-clarity-excellent-durability/br-sheet
https://www.shotshowrangeday.com/
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About the Polycast Bullet Resistant Acrylic Sheet 
 

• Meets the test requirements of Building Code class CC2 

• ANS, Z97.1-Safety Glazing Material 

• Greater than 90 percent light transmission 

• Offered with or without PolyCast SAR™ (Super Abrasion Resistant) coating 
 
Spartech, a U.S.-based and owned manufacturer of custom sheet and rollstock, makes a wide 
range of thermoplastic sheet options which will also be featured at their booth. With a wide 
array of Trademark names; AquaPro™ Multi-Layer Acrylic/ABS Sheet, Crylex™ Weatherable 
Sheet, Floorlite™ Durable Sheets, Korad™ Weatherable Acrylic Films, Polycast™ Bullet Resistant 
Acrylic Sheet, PolyCast™ Color Rods & Tubes, Royalite™ HG Holster Grade Sheet, SoundX™ 
Flexible Acoustic Barrier Sheet, Sparalloy™ Utility Board, SurfaceChoice™ Printed Films, Tuf-
Glas™ Sheet and UltraTuf™ SG Copolyester Sheet.  These products are manufactured within the 
US and can come in any custom color, multiple textures, print designs and thicknesses. 
 
 
 About Spartech 
 
Headquartered in St. Louis, Missouri with a unique innovation center and 15 manufacturing 
facilities located throughout the United States, Spartech is a leading plastics manufacturer of 
engineered thermoplastic materials and specialty packaging products. Meeting the exact 
standards for everything from food packaging to aerospace and automotive applications, 
Spartech continues to make a world of difference with sustainable, diverse, reliable and 
innovative products including Royalite™, Korad™, PreservaPak™, and Polycast™. 
http://spartech.com/ 
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For Spartech  
Greg Severin 
greg@spokemarketing.com 
314.827.0600, x115 
 

https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/abs/aquapro-multi-layer-acrylicabs-sheet
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/polycarbonate-and-impact-modified-acrylic/crylex-weatherable-sheet
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/polycarbonate-and-impact-modified-acrylic/crylex-weatherable-sheet
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/flexible-sheet/floorlite-durable-sheets
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/films/korad-weatherable-acrylic-films
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/superior-clarity-excellent-durability/br-sheet
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/superior-clarity-excellent-durability/br-sheet
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/superior-clarity-excellent-durability/polycast-color-rods-tubes
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/flame-rated-sheet-and-other-specialty-sheet-solutions/royalite-hg
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/flexible-sheet/soundx-flexible-acoustic-barrier
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/flexible-sheet/soundx-flexible-acoustic-barrier
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/abs/sparalloy-utility
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/films/surfacechoice-printed-films
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/polycarbonate-and-impact-modified-acrylic/tuf-glas
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/polycarbonate-and-impact-modified-acrylic/tuf-glas
https://www.spartech.com/products/custom-sheet-rollstock/polyester/ultratuf-sg-copolyester-sheet
http://spartech.com/
mailto:greg@spokemarketing.com

